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From: Hafle, Mark E

Sent: Fri Mar 26 20:41:07 2010

To: Crane, Allison; Morel, Brian P

Cc: Couch, Thomas E

Subject: RE: Request for work on 7" casing
Importance: Normal

Al and Tom,

Let's buy the 7", and we'll take our chances on it's actual use. Plan on starting the breakdown and rig
prep early next week.

Also, please secure the required float equipment and backups

Regards,

Mark Hafle
Crilling Engineer
BP Deepwater GoM
281-366-4237 (0)
281-687-8216 (m)

From: Crane, Allison

Sent: Friday, March 26, 2010 3:09 PM

To: Morel, Brian P; Hafle, Mark E

Cc: Couch, Thomas E

Subject: RE: Request for work on 7" casing

Probably about 3 days. | would just point out that since Nexen does want to sell this
pipe, they will probably sell it to the first firm offer so there is no guarantee this pipe will
continue to be available. Changes are they won't sell it in the next few days but you
never know what can happen. Also, we KNOW we can start on this work on Monday.
However, further delays may impact the availability of crews to do the work.

One final remark on this pipe: since this pipe would be purchased specifically for
Macondo and it really doesn't have much use elsewhere in GoM DW, this purchase
would be charged directly to Macondo and would remain charged there, even if it isn't
used, until we dispose of it.

Thanks

x‘/f [J UL

Materials Management Coordinator
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BP GoM Deepwater Exploration
281-366-5951
allison.crane@bp.com

From: Morel, Brian P

Sent: Friday, March 26, 2010 3:01 PM

To: Crane, Allison; Hafle, Mark E

Cc: Couch, Thomas E

Subject: RE: Request for work on 7" casing

What's timing to get this work done on the pipe?

From: Crane, Allison

Sent: Friday, March 26, 2010 3:00 PM

To: Morel, Brian P; Hafle, Mark E

Cc: Couch, Thomas E

Subject: FW: Request for work on 7" casing

See Nexen's note below. Looks like they want us to commit to buying it before we do
» any prep work. Your call. If you want to proceed with buying it, we will need an
" } approved requisition today.

Al Crane

Materials Management Coordinator
BP GoM Deepwater Exploration
281-366-5951

allison.crane@bp.com

From: Rincon, Pat (Dallas) [mailto:Patricia_Rincon@nexeninc.com]
Sent: Friday, March 26, 2010 2:54 PM

To: Couch, Thomas E

Cc: Crane, Allison

Subject: RE: Request for work on 7" casing

Tom,

Nexen requires a frm commitment to purchase the pipe at the noted price per foot. Please
advise your intent.

Regards,
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Pat C. Rincon

Sr Buyer, Supply Mgrmi.

Nexen Petreleum U.S.A Inc,
5301 Granite Parkway

Suite 1400

Plano Texas 75024

www.nexeninc.cam

T.(972)4504787 = F:(972)45047298 : C.(972)510-8403 . pat rincon@nexeninc.com

From: Couch, Thomas E [mailto:Thomas.Couch@bp.com]
Sent: Friday, March 26, 2010 12:38 PM

To: Rincon, Pat (Dallas)

Cc: Crane, Allison

Subject: RE: Request for work on 7" casing
Impaortance: High

Fat,

For clarification, does Nexen require a firm intent to purchase or agreement to the
M, purchase price of $50.00/ ft. ?
3 BP does agree to the purchase price as noted, but would still like to service the pipe

prior to commitment-to-purchase.

Please advise.
Regards and Thanks,

Tom Couch

BP Exploration & Production Co.

PSCM, Materials Management, GoM SPU
200 Westlake Park Blvd, Room 377A
Houston, TX 77079

Office: 281-366-4858

Cell: 832-260-3286
Thomas.Couch@bp.com

From: Rincon, Pat (Dallas) [ mailto:Patricia_Rincon@nexeninc.com]
Sent: Friday, March 26, 2010 12:23 PM

To: Couch, Thomas E

Cc: Crane, Allison

Subject: RE: Request for work on 7" casing

Gentlemen,

N
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In reference to ycur proposal submitted fcr the 77 casing, Nexen must have a
[irm price for the casing prior to release or servicing of the material.

Nexen’s propcsed Sale of material:

7¢ 32.00# Q-125 HC HYD 513 R-3 USS w/ 5D 6.000”
gty: 133 Jes. / 6,142.307
Price: $50.00 / tt.

Please confirm your acceptance of subject sale of material.
Regards,

Pat Rincon

From: Couch, Thomas E [mailto: Thomas.Couch@bp.com]
Sent: Friday, March 26, 2010 11:25 AM

To: Rincon, Pat (Dallas)

Cc: Crane, Allison

Subject: Request for work on 7" casing

Importance: High

Pat,
Regarding the 133 joints of 7", 32#, HCQ-125, Hyd.513 pipe that Nexen has in Expert's
Yard in Fourchon, BP would like the option of servicing this pipe all at BP's expense.

. Unbuck those joints that are currently in doubles.

« Clean and visually inspect ALL connections.

- Apply running compound on all connections

- (In the event that some connections are galled during the unbucking process, BP

would repair all of those galled connections at BP expense)

Purchase of this pipe is contingent upon success of the well program for which this pipe
is intended.

If BP elects not to purchase the pipe, BP will clean all connections and apply storage
compound of Nexen's choice. All this will be at BP's expense.

in addition, should Nexen want this pipe moved to another storage location, BP will

provide transportation to that location at BP's expense.

Please respond as soon as you can regarding this proposal, as we would like to

proceed with this servicing early next week.
Thanks,

Tam Couch
PSCM, Materials Management D&C, GoM SPU
377A WL4
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Office: 281-366-4858

Cell: 832-260-3286
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IMPORTANT NOTICE: This message is intended for the individual or entity to which it is
addressed and may contain information that is privileged, confidential, and/or exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient. you are hereby notified
that copying, forwarding or other dissemination or distribution of this message is prohibited and
that taking any action in reliance on the content of this message is to be avoided. Should you
receive this e-mail in error, please notify the sender immediately via e-mail or call (403)

699-4000 and delete this message from your system. Thank you.
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IMPORTANT NOTICE: This message is intended for the individual or entity to which it is
addressed and may contain information that is privileged, confidential. and/or exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that copying, forwarding or other dissemination or distribution of this message is prohibited and
that taking any action in reliance on the content of this message is to be avoided. Should you
receive this e-mail in error, please notify the sender immediately via e-mail or call (403)
699-4000 and delete this message from your system. Thank you.
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